
BID TABULATION

ITB #9-18

"SEED & FERTILIZER

SANDRA TELLIS, PRINCIPAL BUYER

205-325-5382

telliss@jccal.org

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE

1 ANNUAL RYEGRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          0.64 LB  $            0.72 LB  $                    0.75 

2 BROWN TOP MILLET 50 LB BAG  $                          0.70 LB  $            0.56 LB  $                    0.80 

3 FALCON TURF TYPE FESCUE 50 LB BAG  $                          1.90 LB  $            1.10 (TITAN) LB  $                    1.95 

4 GRAIN RYE 50 LB BAG  $                          0.40 LB  $            0.32 LB  $                    0.30 

5 HAIRY VETCH 50 LB BAG  $                          2.20 LB  $            1.70 LB  $                    2.50 

6 HULLED BERMUDA GRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          5.00 LB  $            4.00 (COATED) LB  $                    4.80 

7 UNHULLED BERMUDA GRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          2.79 LB  $            3.00 LB  $                    5.00 

8 KENTUCKY 31 TALL RESCUE 50 LB BAG  $                          1.28 LB  $            1.25 LB  $                    1.85 

9 ORCHARD GRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          3.60 LB  N/A LB  $                    3.00 

10 PENSACOLA BAHIA GRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          3.50 LB  $            3.20 LB  $                    4.50 

11 WEEPING LOVEGRASS 50 LB BAG  $                          5.60 LB  $            5.00 LB  $                    8.50 

12 WHEAT 50 LB BAG  $                          0.38 LB  $            0.32 LB  $                    0.25 

13 REGAL LADINO CLOVER 25 LB BAG  $                      144.79 (DURANA) LB  $            5.00 LB  $                    6.00 

14 RESEEDING CRIMSON CLOVER 50 LB BAG  $                        59.79 LB  $            0.88 LB  $                    1.20 

15 WHITE DUTCH CLOVER 50 LB BAG  $                      189.89 LB  $            4.00 LB  $                    3.60 

16 CLOVER CULTURE 50 LB BAG  $                        18.90 

17 CROWN VETCH CULTURE 50 LB BAG  $                        18.90 

18 LESPEDEZA CULTURE 50 LB BAG  $                        18.90 

19 WHITE CLOVER CULTURE 50 LB BAG  $                        18.90 

20 HULLED SERICEA 50 LB BAG  $                      219.78 LB  $            3.90 LB  $                    6.50 

21 UNHULLED SERICEA 50 LB BAG  $                      189.49 LB  $            3.30 

22 KOBE 50 LB BAG  $                      139.79 (KOREAN) LB  $            1.32 

23 CROWN VETCH LB 37.50$            LB 10.00$                   

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE

1 13-13-13 50 LB BAG  $                        10.95 50 LB  $          10.75 50 LB BAG  $                  12.00 

2 8-8-8 50 LB BAG  $                          9.49 50 LB  $            9.95 50 LB BAG  $                    9.00 

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE

OPTION 1 12% RELEASE 50 LB BAG  $                        13.99 

OPTION 2 25% RELEASE 50 LB BAG  $                        14.99 50 LB  $          17.00 

OPTION 3 50% RELEASE 50 LB BAG  $                        15.99 50 LB  $          17.93 

DELIVERY GUARANTEE:

Statement of Compliance

CONTACT INFORMATION

Humphries Farm Turf Supply, Inc. / PO Box 39 / Joppa, AL  35087 / Contact:  Misty Martin / Phone:  256-586-8760 / Fax:  256-586-4342 / Email:  humphriesturf@otelco.net

Pennington Seed, Inc. / 1280 Atlanta Hwy PO Box 290 / Madison, GA  30650 / Contact:  Luke Brackman / Phone:  706-752-4302 / Fax:  706-752-4125 / Email:  lbrackman@central.com

Bid Bond or Cashier's Check

YES

YES YES YES

NO NO NO

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES

YES YES

Notification of Intent to Respond

YES YES

YES YES

YES YES

NO BID

GROUP II: FERTILIZER

EEOC

Non-Collusion

Affidavit of Contractor

UNIVERSAL PRO

STATE SIZE OF PACKAGE: 50 LB BAGS/(1) 25 LB BAG

CLOVERS

INOCULATION CULTURE

GROUP I: GRASS SEED

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY, INC. PENNINGTON SEED, INC.

GROUP III: TIME RELEASE

Universal Pro / PO Box 100637 / Birmingham, AL  35210 / Contact:  Mark Rhodes / Phone:  205-838-1400 / Fax:  205-838-1415 / Email:  markr@agri-afc.com

REQUIRED FORMS

NO BID

50 LB BAGS

5 DAYS

Signature Page

LESPEDEZA SEED

VETCH

N/A

5-7 DAYS N/A



COMMISSION APPROVED DATE: ______________________________

AWARDED TO: _______________________________________________


